
2019 SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFIT) S.R.O. 24
(AMENDMENT)

Short title and
commencement.

Interpretation.
S.R.O. No. 10 of 1976.

Amendment of regulation
2 of the Principal
Regulations.

 COMMONWEALTH OF DOMINICA

STATUTORY RULES AND ORDERS No. 24 OF 2019.

REGULATIONS

MADE by the Minister under section 28 of the Social Security
Act, Chapter 31:01.

(Gazetted 20th June,
2019.)

1. (1) These Regulations may be cited as the –

SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFIT)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2019.

(2) These Regulations are deemed to have come into
force on the 1st day of March, 2019.

2. In these Regulations, the Social Security (Benefit)
Regulations are referred to as “the Principal Regulations”.

3. Regulation 2 of the Principal Regulations is amended
in the definition of “weekly insurable earnings” –

(a) in paragraph (i) by deleting the figure “$1386” and
substituting the figure “$1617”;

(b) in paragraph (ii) by deleting the figure “$6000” and
substituting the figure “$7000.”.

4. Regulation 17 of the Principal Regulations is amended
by –

(a) deleting the words “five hundred dollars” in
subregulations (2) and (5) and substituting the words
“five hundred and seventy-five dollars”; and

Amendment of regulation
17 of the Principal
Regulations.


